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August 11, 2005
RE: Consortium Pipe Bid - 2005
Gentlemen or Madam:

Please be advised that as advertised, Warrington Township received and publicly opened the
2005 Consortium Pipe bids and Pre-Cast bids on Wednesday, July 27, 2005 at 11:00 AM. on
behalf of the participating members of the consortium.

At the time of the pipe bid opening there were only two bids that were received. The bids
opened were from Chemung Supply Corporation and Atlantic Concrete Products.
Enclosed are copies of all documents received,

At that time no bids for RCP, Ductile Iron Pipe, or Bicycle Safety Grates were received;
as this result we have to re-bid for the above listed items only. These items were
advertised for bids by Warrington Township on the initial bid and no bids were received.
The date of the last advertisement was August 9, 2005

Since no bids were received we are permitted to enter into contracts with suppliers of
these items, but only within 45 days of the date of the last advertisement August 9, 2005.
After that date September 27, 2005 the items must be bid again. Please be guided
accordingly.

As you are aware, each municipality is responsible to make its individual award,
including notice to all bidders, and execution of contract and performance bond.

All originals documents are on file at the administrative office located at 852 Easton Rd
Warrington.

Please do not hesitate to call, should you have any questions. (215) 343-9350

Sincerely,

(ol S

Carl Sames
Foreman Of Public Works
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Bucks County Consortium Pipe Bid 2005
July 27, 2005 at 11:05 a.m.

Materials; OQuantity: Bidder 1: Bidder 2:
Atlantic Concrete Chemung
Products Supply Corporation
RCP: No Bids No Bids
Inlet Tops/Boxes and Grates:
- 2x4%C” Inlet Tops 71 $13, 485.00 No Bid
- 2x6%“C” Inlet Tops 16 $ 4,720.00 No Bid
- 2x4%S” Inlet Tops 10 $ 1, 850.00 No Bid
- 2x4“M” Inlet Tops 47 $ 8,695.00 No Bid
Inlet Boxes:
- 18” Inside height Inlet Box 17 $4, 887.50 No Bid
- 24 Inside height Inlet Box 27 $9, 315.00 No Bid
- 30” Inside height Inlet 6 $2, 310.00 No Bid
- 36" Inside height Inlet 20 $9, 200.00 No Bid
- - 42" Inside height Inlet 2 $1, 554.00 No Bid
- 15" End Wall 0 $ 540.00 No Bid
- 247 End Wall 0 $ 865.00 No Bid
- 18" End Wall 0 $ 650.00 No Bid
- 42" End Wall 0 $1, 645.00 No Bid
- 36" End Wall 0 $1, 405.00 No Bid
- _.End Wall _ 1 No Bid No Bid
State Spec Grates:
- 2x4 State Spec Grates 86 $24,080.00 $584.00
- 2x6 State Spec Grates 2 $ 890.00 $824.00
Steel Grates: 0 No Bids No Bids
Bicycle Safety Steel Grates: 0 No Bids No Bids
Cor Suel Pipe (16ga):
12” Cor Steel Pipe (16ga) 590 ft No Bid $ 593
- 157 Cor Steel Pipe (16ga) 91t No Bid $ 748
- 18" Cor Stecl Pipe (16ga) 300 ft No Bid $ 9.08
- 24" Cor Steel Pipe (16ga) 50f No Bid $ 1222
- 30" Cor Steel Pipe (16ga) 50f No Bid $ 1438
- 13" 17 Cor Steel Pipe 900 ft No Bid $ 789
- 177x 23" Cor Steel Pipe 5501t No Bid $ 11.38
- 217x27” Cor Steel Pipe 420 ft No Bid $ 13.12
- 127 Steel Bands 8 No Bid $ 593
- 13”x 17 Steel Brands 8 No Bid $ 789
- 4 x7 Cor Alum Pipe 2 40 ft No Bid $124.88
- 4x7 Cor Alum Brands 3 No Bid $185.00
- 18”x23” Cor Alum 2 60 f No Bid $ 1424
- 18"x23” Cor Alum Bands 3 No Bid $ 1424
Cor Alum Pipe (16ga):
8” Cor Alum Pipe (16ga) 0 No Bid $ 824
- 12" Cor Alum Pipe (16ga) 0 No Bid $10.18
- 157 Cor Alum Pipe (16ga) 50ft No Bid $10.58
- 18" Cor Alum Pipe (16ga) 50f No Bid $12.68
- 247 Cor Alum Pipe (16ga) S0t No Bid $17.94
- 30" Cor Alum Pipe (16ga) 501 No Bid $19.94
- 36" Cor Alum Pipe (16ga) 0 No Bid $28.64
- 15” Aluminum Bands 10 No Bid $10.58
Cor Po!y Vinyl- Black:
4” Cor Poly Black Vinyl 0 No Bid $ 029
- 6’ Cor Poly Black Vinyl 0 No Bid $ 0.78
- 127 Cor Poly Black Vinyl 0 No Bid $ 414
- 15" Cor Poly Black Vinyl 0 No Bid $519
- 18" Cor Poly Vinyl 100 ft No Bid $ 7.69
- 24” Cor Poly Black Vinyl 100 ft No Bid $11.94
- 30” Cor Poly Black Vinyl 0 No Bid No Bid




Bucks County Consortium Pipe Bid 2005
July 27, 2005 at 11:05 a.m.

Materials; tity: Bidder 1: Bidder 2:
Atlantic Concrete Chemung Supply
Products Corporation

Connecting Bands:

- 4" Connecting Bands 0 No Bid $ 0.85

- 6” Connecting Bands 0 No Bid $ 1.60

- 12” Connecting Bands 0 No Bid $ 414

- 15” Connecting Bands 0 No Bid $ 5.19

- 18” Connecting Bands 0 No Bid $ 7.69

- 24" Connecting Bands 0 No Bid $11.94

- 30” Connecting Bands 0 No Bid No Bid

Cor PolyVinyl - Black
N-12 Smooth Bore:

- 15" Cor Poly Black Vinyl Smooth Bore 3400 ft No Bid $ 5.18
- 18” Cor Poly Vinyl Smooth Bore 900 ft No Bid $ 768
- 24" Cor Poly Black Vinyl Smooth Bore 800 ft No Bid ‘ $11.92
- 30” Cor Poly Black Vinyl Smooth Bore 200 ft No Bid $18.84
Smooth Poly Perforated Plastic and
PVC Pipe: 0 No Bid $3.99
- 12” Smooth Poly 400 fi No Bid $5.18
- 15” Smooth Poly 300t ‘No Bid $7.68
- 18” Smooth Poly
Perforated Plastic:
- 8" Perforated Plastic 300 ft No Bid $1.59
PVC Green:
- 4”SDR-35 500 ft No Bid $ 112
- 6” SDR-35 1000 ft No Bid $ 232
- 8" SDR-35 1000 ft No Bid $ 4.08
- 10” SDR-35 250 ft No Bid $ 649
- 4" C9000-Class 150 500t No Bid $ 272
- 6" C900- Class 150 1000 ft No Bid $ 5.34
- 8 C900- Class 150 5000 ft No Bid $ 9.24
- 10” C 900- Class 152 1000 ft No Bid $13.89
Schedule 40 with Holes:
- 4” Schedule 40 with holes 0 No Bid $2.28
- 6" Schedule 40 with holes 0 No Bid $3.99
- 8" Schedule 40 with holes 0 No Bid $6.03
Schedule 40 without Holes:
- 4” Schedule 40 without holes 200 ft No Bid $2.04
- 6” Schedule 40 without holes 0 No Bid $3.58
- 8” Schedule 40 without holes 0 No Bid $5.49
Ductile Iron Pipe: No Bids No Bids
Ductile Iron Pipe:
" - Geo Tectile Filter Fabric Roll 5 No Bid $424.00




